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Iowa Code § 96.5(1) – Voluntary Leaving 
      
STATEMENT OF THE CASE: 
 
The claimant filed a timely appeal from the September 26, 2006, reference 01, decision that 
denied benefits.  After due notice was issued, a telephone conference hearing was held on 
October 17, 2006.  Claimant participated.  Employer participated through Dee Pearce and Bill 
Mooberry.   
 
ISSUE: 
 
The issue is whether claimant quit the employment without good cause attributable to the 
employer. 
 
FINDINGS OF FACT: 
 
Having heard the testimony and having reviewed the evidence in the record, the administrative 
law judge finds:  Claimant was employed as a full-time sander from July 12, 2004 until 
September 7, 2006 when she quit because of perceived harassment by coworkers and the plant 
manager.  She never complained to her supervisor.   
 
REASONING AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW: 
 
For the reasons that follow, the administrative law judge concludes the claimant voluntarily left 
employment without good cause attributable to the employer. 
 
Iowa Code § 96.5-1 provides:   
 

An individual shall be disqualified for benefits:  
 
1.  Voluntary quitting.  If the individual has left work voluntarily without good cause 
attributable to the individual's employer, if so found by the department. 

 
An individual who voluntarily leaves their employment must first give notice to the employer of 
the reasons for quitting in order to give the employer an opportunity to address or resolve the 
complaint.  Cobb v. Employment Appeal Board, 506 N.W.2d 445 (Iowa 1993).  An employee 
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who receives a reasonable expectation of assistance from the employer after complaining about 
working conditions must complain further if conditions persist in order to preserve eligibility for 
benefits.  Polley v. Gopher Bearing Company, 478 N.W.2d 775 (Minn. App. 1991).  Claimant 
was not required to give notice of his intention to quit due to an intolerable, detrimental or 
unsafe working environment if employer had or should have had reasonable knowledge of the 
condition.  Hy-Vee, Inc. v. Employment Appeal Bd., 710 N.W.2d 1 (Iowa 2005). 
 
Inasmuch as the claimant did not give the employer an opportunity to resolve her complaints 
prior to leaving employment, the separation was without good cause attributable to the 
employer.  Benefits are denied. 
 
DECISION: 
 
The September 26, 2006, reference 01, decision is affirmed.  The claimant voluntarily left her 
employment without good cause attributable to the employer.  Benefits are withheld until such 
time as she has worked in and been paid wages for insured work equal to ten times her weekly 
benefit amount, provided she is otherwise eligible. 
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Dévon M. Lewis 
Administrative Law Judge 
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